
Advanced EMT

SOUTHWEST MS COMMUNITY
COLLEGE WORKFORCE 

*Take your EMT-Basic
certification to the next
level with our Advanced
EMT course

*Classes will meet from  
 8am-12pm on Tuesdays
and Thursdays beginning
July 26-December 15,
2022

*$700 course fee
includes textbook,
workbook, shirt, clinical
insurance and NREMT
exam fee

*Space is limited

*Deadline to complete
registration is July 8,
2022 

*Call 601-276-2442 or
601-276-3836 or email
lgerald@smcc.edu for
more information.

Prerequisites include:
*Proof of NREMT Basic
certification required
along with current
physical, driver's license,
negative TB skin test,
background check release
form, and a completed
registration form. Clinical
requires a Covid vaccine
or religious exemption
approval.
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